
Stones Road, Epsom



Guide Price £500,000

• End of terraced home

• Three bedrooms

• Central no through road

• Short walk to Town & Station

• Two reception rooms

• Modern kitchen with butler sink

• Downstairs bathroom

• Good sized garden with side access

• Detached garden cabin/workshop

• Residents on street parking scheme

Freehold

Tucked away within a rarely available no through road
that is easy walking distance of Epsom town centre,
with its array of shops, public houses and restaurants,
as well as being just 0.5 miles from the railway station.

The truly flexible property benefits from an excellent
amount of natural light, so whether you are wanting to
downsize but not downgrade, or you are a
professional couple or a young family, this property
offers something for everyone with its truly versatile
accommodation, scope to extend if desired and
fantastic position within walking distance of all local
amenities.

The Personal Agent are delighted to present to the
market this three bedroom home. Arranged over two

floors the property is ready to move in to, with
accommodation consisting of an entrance porch,
hallway, living room with French doors to garden,
dining room, fitted kitchen, modern bathroom with
white suite and three bedrooms.

There is a generously proportioned rear garden with
paved terrace, gate to the side, lawned area and a
detached garden cabin. The fenced borders ensure
that the garden enjoys a good degree of privacy, with
a shared access path to the rear of the garden.

Epsom High Street has a variety of shops, the Ashley
Centre - a covered shopping mall and Epsom
Playhouse which offers a wide range of entertainment,
including films and concerts. The Rainbow Leisure

Centre & David Lloyd Centre feature pool, gym and
other sports facilities. There is also a wide variety of
cafés, restaurants and pubs available locally. 

Epsom is a popular commuter town, located to the
south west of London and offers a good mix of state
and independent schools for all age groups. Also close
by is Epsom Downs, the home of The Derby. The M25
(Junction 9) is a short drive away giving access to both
Heathrow and Gatwick international airports.

Tenure - Freehold
Council tax band - D










